
EMERGENCY MANAGEMENT ACT (EXCERPT)
Act 390 of 1976

30.408 Emergency management coordinator; employment or appointment; duties; annexes to emergency
management plan; cooperation of state agencies.

Sec. 8.

    (1) The director of each department of state government, and those agencies of state government required by the
Michigan emergency management plan to provide an annex to that plan, shall serve as emergency management
coordinator for their respective departments or agencies. Each director may appoint or employ a designated
representative as emergency management coordinator, provided that the representative shall act for and at the
direction of that director while functioning in the capacity of emergency management coordinator upon the
activation of the state emergency operations center, or the declaration of a state of disaster or emergency. Each
department or agency emergency management coordinator shall act as liaison between his or her department or
agency and the emergency management division of the department in all matters of emergency management,
including the activation of the Michigan emergency management plan. Each department or agency of state
government specified in the Michigan emergency management plan shall prepare and continuously update an annex
to the plan providing for the delivery of emergency management activities by that agency or the department. The
annexes shall be in a form prescribed by the director. The emergency management coordinator shall represent the
agency or department head in the drafting and updating of the respective agency's or the department's emergency
management annex and in coordinating the agency's or department's emergency management efforts with those of
the other state agencies as well as with county and municipal governments.
    (2) Upon the declaration of a state of disaster or a state of emergency by the governor, each state agency shall
cooperate to the fullest possible extent with the director in the performance of the services that it is suited to
perform, and as described in the Michigan emergency management plan, in the prevention, mitigation, response to,
or recovery from the disaster or emergency. For purposes of this section, the judicial branch of this state is
considered a department of state government and the chief justice of the Michigan supreme court is considered the
director of that department.

History: 1976, Act 390, Imd. Eff. Dec. 30, 1976 ;-- Am. 1990, Act 50, Imd. Eff. Apr. 6, 1990 ;-- Am. 2002, Act 132, Eff. May 1, 2002
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